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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 
 

KSENIA EFREMOVA AND LUIS GUTO MIGUEL VICTORIOUS AT THE 
REPENTIGNY NATIONAL BANK JUNIOR TENNIS CHAMPIONSHIPS 

Luis Guto Miguel captures both the singles and doubles titles 

 
[TORONTO, ON] September 2, 2025 – The Repentigny National Bank Junior Tennis Championships 
(ITJR) concluded Saturday, with champions crowned in both the girls’ and boys’ divisions. Held at Parc 
Larochelle in Repentigny, Quebec, the J300 tournament saw France’s Ksenia Efremova and Brazil’s Luis 
Guto Miguel emerge as singles champions. Miguel swept the podium on the boys’ side, also winning the 
doubles event alongside Slovenia’s Ziga Sesko.  
 
Efremova, the No. 4 seed, began her road to the title with a straight-set victory over Canadian wild card 
Ziye Liu. The 16-year-old then beat four seeds, including Chinese players Yushan Shao (No. 2 seed) in 
the semi-final and Yihan Qu (No. 7 seed) in the championship match, to capture her second title of the 
season. Efremova did not lose a set throughout the tournament, conceding only 19 games in five 
matches.   
 
In the boys’ division, No. 3 seed Miguel edged past American Sean Grosman 6-0, 6-7(7), 6-3 in his 
opening match, before defeating No. 5 seed Kuan-Shou Chen of Chinese Taipei, No. 1 seed Sesko, and 
No. 11 seed Gavin Goode of the United States en route to the title. This is Miguel's second singles crown 
of the season, after winning the J300 Charleroi-Marcinelle in May, where Efremova also won her previous 
title. 
 
It was a busy week for the singles champions, as Efremova and Miguel both reached the title match in 
doubles in their respective divisions. Efremova and partner Kali Supova of Slovakia were the top seeds 
and finished as runners-up, losing by walkover to all-American duo of Carrie-Anne Hoo and Kaya Moe. 
Hoo and Moe won a thrilling semi-final match against their compatriots Kennedy Drenser-Hagmann and 
Karlin Schock 6-4, 3-6, 10-8. Miguel and Sesko, the No. 1 seeds in the boys’ draw, also survived a semi-
final battle 6-4, 3-6, 10-7, before comfortably beating No. 4 seeds Yannik Alvarez of Puerto Rico and 
Ryan Cozad of the United States 6-1, 6-2 in the final.  
 
Miguel becomes the seventh player win both the singles and doubles titles in the boys’ division at the 
ITJR – a feat first achieved by Andy Murray in 2003. For more information about the ITJR, including the 
list of past winners, click here. 
 
About Tennis Canada 

Founded in 1890, Tennis Canada is a non-profit, national sport association with a mission to lead the 

growth, development and promotion of tennis in Canada and a vision to be a world-leading tennis nation. 

We value teamwork, passion, integrity, innovation and excellence. Tennis Canada owns and operates the 

premier National Bank Open presented by Rogers WTA and ATP Tour events, it financially supports 15 

other professional tournaments in Canada, as well as operating more than 60 events nationally across 

junior, wheelchair, university and Masters tennis categories. Tennis Canada is a proud member of the 

International Tennis Federation, the Canadian Olympic Committee and the Canadian Paralympic 

https://itjr.ca/en
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Committee, and serves to administer, sponsor and select the teams for Davis Cup, Billie Jean King Cup, 

the Olympic and Paralympic Games and all wheelchair, junior and masters tennis national teams. Tennis 

Canada invests its surplus into tennis development. For more information on Tennis Canada please visit 

our website at: www.tenniscanada.com and follow us on LinkedIn, X, Facebook and Instagram. 
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